
 Stop! Is that poop on your 
lemon? 
 A science professor dares to find 
out what germs lurk on your gar-
nishes 
 It's fairly common for restaurant 
staffers to place a lemon slice on the 
rim of a beverage glass as a flavor 
enhancer or decorative garnish. But 
who knows whether these lemons 
have been handled using sanitary 
procedures? Anne LaGrange Lov-
ing, a professor of science at Passaic 
County Community College, de-
cided to find out.  
 Loving began her investigation 
after she saw a waitress’ fingertips 
dip into her soda as the drink was 
being brought to her table. Although 
lemon juice is known to kill germs, 
Loving devised a study to determine 
whether lemon slices contain germs 
when they are served to customers.  
 Using sterile collection swabs, 
Loving took two samples from each 
of 76 lemons that were served in 
restaurants in North Jersey. Patrons 
normally start to drink a beverage 

moments after it is served, so sam-
ples were taken right away, before a 
sip was taken and before anyone at 
the table touched it. One swab was 
rubbed along the rind, while a sec-
ond was rubbed along the pulp. The 
restaurants were unaware that she 
was doing this. Samples were then 
analyzed for microbes at a clinical 
microbiology laboratory. 
 A total of 25 different types of 
germs were found on 53 out of the 
76 lemons that were sampled. Some 
were fecal in origin (either from 
dirty fingertips of the restaurant em-
ployees, or from meat-contaminated 
cutting boards and knives), while 
others were types commonly found 
in saliva, on the skin and in the envi-

ronment. 
 One sample had six different mi-
croorganisms on it, three of which 
are found in fecal material.  Al-
though some lemon slices had germs 
either only on the rind or only on the 
pulp, 29 percent had germs on both 
sites. In 15 instances the germs on 
the pulp were completely different 
from those on the rind, indicating 
that the pulp had been in contact 
with a contaminated surface as or 
after it was sliced. Sometimes when 
more than one lemon was sampled 
during a single restaurant visit, dif-
ferent germs were found on each. 
 Although there have been no re-
ported outbreaks of illnesses attrib-
uted to lemon slices in beverages, 
every microorganism that was re-
covered had the potential to cause a 
variety of human infections. Estab-
lishment of an infection would de-
pend upon the numbers and types of 
germs involved, the general health 
and age of the person and whether 
the person had chapped lips or a 
cold sore on the lips or gums. 
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